
 
 

SHELL Q2’11 PROMOTION - $8 off† Shell Fuels + Treats! 
 

TERMS AND CONDITIONS  

 

1. From 11 April to 22 May 2011 (“Promotion Period”), with every S$50.00 purchase of any Shell fuels 
(before any applicable station, card discount or rebate) in a single receipt at Shell stations in 
Singapore, customers will receive a sticker (“Sticker”), upon presenting this card (“Card”). If the 
purchase is in multiples of S$50.00, a Sticker will be given for every S$50.00. 

 
2. Customers can collect the Stickers on the cards and present them for a treat (“Treat”). The type and 

value of the Treat shall be determined by Shell and may change from time to time without notice to 
the Customer. A Treat will be given for every S$50.00. In addition, when Customers next purchase a 
minimum of gross $50.00 of fuels at any Shell station, they may present a completed Card (i.e. with 3 
Stickers) to the cashier before making payment to receive $8.00 off. Only one completed card may be 
used for each fuel purchase.  

 
3. Completed Cards may be presented to get $8 off the next fuel purchase until 5 June 2011. However, 

the $8 off promotion cannot be used in conjunction with other offers, discounts, discount vouchers, 
privileges or promotions unless otherwise stated. No extensions will be permitted. 
 

4. Stickers or Treats will not be issued during the “Shell V-Power at the price of Shell FuelSave 98” 
promotion. The $8.00 off promotion is not valid during any “Shell V-Power at the price of Shell 
FuelSave 98” promotion.  

 
5. Customers may only collect Stickers and redeem Treats during the Promotion Period. Shell will not 

under any circumstances, extend the expiry date of any incomplete Card or extend the date for 
redemption. 

 
6. Individual Cards with less than 3 Stickers each will be considered incomplete and cannot be 

combined for redemption. 
 

7. Treats are distributed only while stocks last. During the Promotion Period, stocks of Stickers, Treats 
or Cards may run out at particular stations. Shell shall bear no liability to the customer in such a case.   
   

8. Treats are subject to their respective terms and condit ions and those stated herein.  
 

9. Stickers, Treats and/or Cards are NOT exchangeable either wholly or partially, for cash or for other 
goods and services.  

 
10. Only original Cards and Stickers will be accepted. The completed Card is valid for one time use and 

will be retained by Shell Eastern Petroleum (Pte.) Ltd (“Shell”) upon redemption. 
 

11. This promotion does not apply to Corporate Shell Card purchases and Shell Preferred Partners 
Program.  
 

12. Incomplete or failure to provide true and accurate information, failure to submit original receipts upon 
collection of the Treat will automatically disqualify the participant from the promotion. Even if the 
completed card is presented, Shell shall have the sole discretion to determine whether any participant 
should be disqualified by reason of failure to abide by these terms and conditions, bad faith, fraud or 
any other legitimate reason.  



 
13. Shell shall not be liable in any manner whatsoever for any claims, losses, damage, costs or expenses 

in connection with or arising from this promotion, the redemption or use of the Treats .  
 

14. Shell reserves the right to change any Treats and/or the terms and conditions of this promotion at its 
discretion without prior notice or liability to you. All decisions made by Shell in respect of this 
promotion or in the event of any dispute are final and no correspondence will be entertained.  

 
15. Shell will not be responsible for the loss of or damage to Stamp Cards. 


